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NSW ICAC
FW: TWT 315829 EXHIBIT

From: Nerm Cerreto (normeerreto@hotmail.com)
Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2013 12:44:30 PM
To:  Charles Parisi Parisi (charles@parisiassociates.com.au)

Hi Charles,

this is what | spoke to you about the other day.
[ think they have made a mistake and | don’t owe this money can you send a reply.

Kind Regards Norm Cerreto

Date: Sun, 5 May 2013 20:12:26 +1000

Subject: TWT 315829

From: contactus@weeklytimes.com.au

To: normeerreto@hotmaii.com; info@delitaliz.net.au

Hi Norm

Can you please acknowiedge this email and give us an indication when you are going to start paying

towards this account.

Also, the Bietola Family has not paid as yet. We are holding you responsible for the payment as the

orders came from you.
Regards

Ulrike Eichmeyer
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Outlook Print Message NSW IC AC
EXHIBIT

Coxs rd Masterplan

From: Norm Cerreto (normcerreto@hotmail.com)
Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2013 7:55:06 PM

To: Ray Fazzolari (rayf@propertyestates.com.au)
Bee:  Charles Parisi Parisi (charles@parisiassociates.com.au);
charles@parisilawyers.com.au (charles@parisilawyers.com.au)

Hi Ray,
Long time no see Ray, hope you and Maria had a good holiday.

Just a quick note to let you know that | received an email from John Booth regarding outstanding
accounts from last year regarding the advertisement in his papers.

He stated that he spoke with Annette and Seb and they told him they will not be paying for the
advertisements as agreed, due to internal disputes.

john asked if | could pay the account as his point of contact was with me,

So | am just keeping you in the loop and will pay all outstanding advertisement accounts regarding
the Coxs-Rd Masterplan for the period between May and July 4 2012,

Lets catch up soon for a coffee when you have time.

Kind Regards Norm Cerreto
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NSW ICAC
EXHIBIT

weekly times advertisement

From: Norm Cerreto (nonncerreto@hotmaﬂ.com)
Sent: Friday, 14 June 2013 8:55:18 AM
To: Charles Parisi Parisi (charles@parisiassociates.com.au)

Hi Charles
| have discussed with Mr Ray Fazzolari the costs of advertisement for the Coxs Rd Masterplan.

As they have a dispute internally between directors of the Coxs Rd Mall - Enrico Bietola Pty Ltd |
will pay their half of the costs associated with advertisement campaign.

On 4 December 2012 | paid via direct deposit $6270.00

The total advertisement period was between 23 May 2012- 4 July 2012 which amounted to $
13,870.00 inc GST. Hence we will pay another $7600.00 :

The invoices previously forwarded however have the campaign finishing September which is an
error and something which we are not responsible for.

Kind Regards Norm Cerreto



